
BID TABULATION

LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND

2 360

NO BID $3.70 04

3 180

NO BID $5.66 04

4 96

NO BID $4.49 07

5 576

$1.22 10 $0.97 10

12 PER 

CASE

** 3M 

MINIMUM 

12/CS

** 3M 

12/CS 

** 3M 

MIN 96  

12/CS

**  

SAMSILL 

MINIMUM 

$800 IN 

FULL 

CASES

BID #2806  (Req. 156526)

Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

99 OR EQUAL

04 3M 845

07 WILSON JONES 368-14 NBC

08 AVERY DENNISON K311-10

09 WILSON JONES 27616

10 SAMSILL 11302

02 MEAD 25-2832

03 K311-1 K&M CO.

04 ASSOCIATED L2-A1181-BE

05 ASSOCIATED C1181-BE

06 BOORUM PEASE 88730-1

06 RUBBERMAID 69176 (BLACK) 221-481

07 CONTINENTAL 2818BK

1510020

BINDER, 3 RING, 1" CAPACITY, BLUE VINYL 

,***1510020

99 OR EQUAL

01 VERNON #25-2832

01 RUBBERMAID #2830

02 LOMA 823

03 RUBBERMAID 2956 15X11X15 RECTANGULAR

04 TENEX 16024 RECT. 7 GAL

05 RUBBERMAID 69179

1420995

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 3"WX540"L, ,***1420995

99 OR EQUAL

04 3M 845

1510015

WASTEBASKET, RECTANGULAR PLASTIC 12 3/4"DIA X 16 

1/4"H, 7 GALLON, GRAY OR BLACK ,***1510015

99 OR EQUAL



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

6 180

NO BID $1.69 08

7 96

NO BID NO BID

9 2100

NO BID

$7.80

NOT 

ACCEPTA

BLE** 

SAMSILL 

MIN 

$800 

ANY 

COMBO 

FULL 

CASES

04 L2-A1182-BE

11 SOUTHWEST 114240M

04 PRUDENTIAL FEIDCO 22571

05 AVERY 43-461

06 IMPERIAL 1142 40M

07 EVERETTE 1040

10 OFFICE DEPOT MNT-012/342-444

07 TOPS41200 (524-975)/NOT ACCEPTABLE

1510040

BOOK, COMPOSITION, 40 SHEET/80PAGE ,10 X 8", 25 

COUNT, LINNET COVERING, FAINT RULING, 12 PER

99 OR EQUAL

02 MEAD 09-4075

03 CLASSMATE #1040

99           

ROARING 

SPRINGS 

#77341    

12 PER 

PKG / 

144 PER 

CARTON

1510025

BINDER, 3 RING, 2" CAPACITY, BLUE VINYL 

,***1510025

02 EASTMAN ER110

03 WEBBER P3-206030

04 IMPERIAL 11300

05 HAMMOND & STEVENS 610-P

06 ELAN R1010

10 WILSON JONES WO5504 **NOT ACCEPTABLE*

11 WLJ36844NBL

1510035 BOOK, CLASS RECORD, TEACHER'S, K-12, 

SPIRAL BOUND ,***1510035

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 GEOGRAPHY WORK BOOK COMPANY #201

05 C1182-BE

06 BOORUM PEASE 88-7321 (VERNON)

07 GLOBE

08 SAMSILL*NOT ACCEPTABLE*

09 AVERY K311-2

99 OR EQUAL

01 VERNON #25-4832

02 MEAD #25-4832

03 K311-2 K&M CO.



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

10 300

NO BID NO BID

11 204

NO BID $8.80 09

16 504

NO BID $32.18 99

**MIN 

TOPS/OX

FORD 

$1,100 

6 

PKG/CS

1510073 LAMINATING FILM, 27" x 250', 3ML 1" CORE 2 

ROLLS PER BOX, CO-POLYMER ,***1510073

01 FRANK WILBER  ** NOT ACCEPTABLE

02 GBC 3126514

99 OR EQUAL

03 RL-27

07 PACON 9951

08 ASSOCIATED C6925 GG

09 TOPS 8021

10 ROARING SPRINGS

11 TOPS 8001

02 WESTAB 43-8614 6 PKG/CASE

03 PROSPECTOR W-31-69-40

04 NATIONAL 36-746

05 VERNON 43-8418

06 MEAD 43080 GREEN

08 IMPERIAL 11380

09 HAMMOND & STEVEN 400-P

1510055

STENO NOTEBOOK, GREGG RULE, 6X9",12 PER PKG, 80 

PAGES ,***1510055

99 OR EQUAL

01 LIVEWIRE #L9

03 G W SCHOOL SUPPLY

04 PAC. CENTRAL W755

05 EASTMAN EP-7WC

06 WEBER P3-206040

07 ELAN W101

1510045

BOOK, DAILY LESSON PLAN 11 X 9 3/8", 52 SHEETS, 

TWIN WIRE, 7 PERIODS ,***1510045

99 OR EQUAL

01 WESTAB INC #50-1500

02 MEAD 50-1500

$16.09 

per 

roll 

**MIN 

120 

ROLLS 

BRYCE 

COCULAM 

03-273-

IC  

2/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

17 6000

$1.26 04 $1.01 04

18 5004

$2.12 05 $1.61 05

12 PER 

CASE 12/CS

19 708

$3.64 99 $2.62 08

12/CS

**SAMSI

LL MIN  

24/CS

08 SAMSILL 18587C

10 SCHOOL SMART SSI 086397

03 OXFORD RV3WE

04 GBC 8313051

05 WILSON JONES 27608

06 UNIVERSAL 20992

07 WJ 362-49W

05 SAMSILL 18567C

1510077 BINDER, VIEW, 3" WHITE STANDARD ROUND 

RING, 8 1/2 X 11 WHITE VINYL W/ CLEAR OVERLAY 480 

SHEET CAPACITY ,***1510077

99 OR EQUAL

01 WJ/ACCO 362-49W

02 ABISCO MBEV11-30WE

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD B & P RV2WE

02 GBC 8313003

03 WILSON JONES 27606

04 WJ W362-44W

03 WILSON JONES WO-5506 *NOT ACCEPTABLE*

04 SAMSILL 18537C (1160308)

05 WJ 362-14W/12PER CASE

06 JUST BASICS BASIC ROUND RING  (OFFICE DEPOT 

396291)1510076  BINDER, VIEW, 2" WHITE ,***1510076

04 HOP LR-3X2T125OY ***UNACCEPTABLE

1510075

BINDER, VIEW, 1" WHITE ,***1510075

99 OR EQUAL

01 AVERY DENNISON CV 11-10

02 OXFORD RV1 WE

SAMSILL 

11807

12 PER 

CASE

$16.09 

per 

roll 

**MIN 

120 

ROLLS 

BRYCE 

COCULAM 

03-273-

IC  

2/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

20 3000

$1.86 02 $1.42 02

12/CS

21 600

NO BID $0.69 01

22 600

NO BID $0.43 99

24 504

NO BID $0.69 01

** MIN 

$1,100    

7320BLU 

100 

PKGS/CS

PYRAMID 

1286202

** 

7320CAN 

100 

PKGS/CS

12 PER 

CASE

02 GLOBE WEIS

03 ASSOC. #C305-CA

08 IMPERIAL 1658CR

1510094 CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, CANARY, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510094

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD #7320

04 SCM H610

03 LABELON H4-CP20

04 CHAS LEONARD 200-CL

05 FALCON PP C

06 STANDARDS PP-CLR

07 SCHOOL SMART 003354

06 SCHOOL SMART SSI 088724

1510091

PUSH PINS, CLEAR, 100 PER BOX ,***1510091

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 MOORE

02 ROGER

01 OXFORD #7320

02 GLOBE WEIS 350DG

03 ASSOCIATED F3-C305-BE

04 SCM H610

05 GAYLORD QL379L-02

99 OR EQUAL

03 AVERY CV11-15WE

04 JUST BASICS #396251 OFFICE DEPOT

1510090

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, BLUE, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510090

99 OR EQUAL

1510079

BINDER, VIEW, 1.5" WHITE STANDARD ROUND RING, 8 

1/2 X 11 WHITE VINYL W/ CLEAR OVERLAY 280 SHEET 

CAPACITY ,***1510079

01 WILSON JONES W362-34W

02 SAMSILL 18557C



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

25 204

NO BID $0.69 01

26 420

NO BID $0.69 01

** 7320 

GRE 

100 

PKS/CS

27 3000

NO BID $0.26 07

** 

7320CHE 

100 

PKGS/CS

** 100 

PKGS/CS

09 RIVERSIDE

10 MEAD 63002

11 APC IND35P

12 SCHOOL SMART 088708

13 1200WE

04 UPG 035

05 DATACOM 88221

06 SCM 610

07 OXFORD #30

08 RIVERSIDE

1510102

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, WHITE, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510102

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD #7320

02 GLOBE WEIS 350SX

03 ASSOC #CO35

01 OXFORD #7320

04 SCM H610

02 GLOBE WEIS

03 ASSOC #C305-GN

05 GAYLORD QL379L-10

02 GLOBE WEIS 350DG

04 SCM H610

03 ASSOCIATED C305 CH

1510098

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, GREEN, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510098

99 OR EQUAL

1510096

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, CHERRY, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510096

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD #7320



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

28 600

NO BID $0.50 06

29 504

NO BID $0.50 02

30 204

NO BID $0.86 04

 

31 2640

NO BID $0.26 06

 

** 60 

PKGS/CS

** 60 

PKGS/CS

** 40 

PKS/CS

05 DATACOM 88225

06 SCM 810

1510108

CARDS, INDEX, RULED, WHITE, 3X5", 100/PKG 

,***1510108

99 OR EQUAL

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD #7520

02 GLOBE WEIS 580SX

03 ASSOC. #CO58

04 OXFORD 50

04 DATACOM 88222

05 SCM 700

06 RIVERSIDE

07 APCIND46RL

1510106

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, WHITE, 5X8", 100/PKG 

,***1510106

1510105

CARDS, INDEX, RULED, WHITE, 4X6 ", 100/PKG 

,***1510105

99 OR EQUAL

01 GLOBE #461-SX

02 OXFORD #41

03 ASSOCIATED F3-C46

04 DATACOM 88223

05 SCM 710

06 OXFORD 40

07 APC IND46P

08 SSS1210WE

1510104

CARDS, INDEX, PLAIN, WHITE, 4X6", 100/PKG 60 PKG 

PER CASE) ,***1510104

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD #7420

02 GLOBE WEIS 460SX

03 ASSOC #CO46



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

32 204

NO BID $0.86 04

33 38040

NO BID $0.286 02

34 708
NO BID NO BID

** 100 

PKGS/CS

** 40 

PKGS/CS

 ** 

ELMERS 

MIN 

$750 

96/CS

02 GENERAL BC-010

03 SCHOOL SMART 038221

04 UNV 10199

05 QUILL 720100

06 IMPERIAL 1294010

99 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

03 ELMER'S E556 (.24 OZ)

1510130  BINDER CLIPS, MINI ***1510130

99 OR EQUAL

01 HIGHMARK

06 OXFORD 58

07 ESSELTE 90198

08 APC IND58RL

1510122  GLUE STICK, CLASSROOM, CLEAR NON TOXIC, 

.20-.24 OZ ,***1510122

02 BORDEN ELMERS E510 (.21 OZ.)

01 OXFORD #7521

02 GLOBE WEIS 581SX

03 ASSOCIATED F3-C58

04 OXFORD 51

05 UNIVERSAL 58

07 RIVERSIDE 04852

08 MEAD 63000

09 APC-IND35RL

1510110 CARDS, INDEX, RULED, WHITE, 5X8", 100/PKG 

,***1510110

99 OR EQUAL

02 GLOBE WEIS 351SX

03 ASSOCIATED C35

04 DATACOM 88220

05 SCM 600

06 OXFORD 31

01 OXFORD #7321



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

35 900

NO BID $0.19 03

36 900

NO BID $0.40 99

37 504

NO BID $0.91 03

PYRAMID 

BC-10 

#111607

5

38 2040

NO BID $0.20 09

PYRAMID 

1110667

06 IMPERIAL 1294-100

1510150

CLIPS, PAPER, SMALL, 100 PER BOX, 10/CTN PER 

CARTON, 1 1/4" LENGTH ,***1510150

02 QUILL

01 OFFICE DEPOT 308-957

03 PYRAMID BC-10

04 GENERAL BC-100

05 OFFICE DEPOT 308-957

05 IMPERIAL 1294-050

06 SCHOOL SMART

07 SCHOOL SMART 032403

1510145

BINDER CLIPS, LARGE,  2", BOX OF 12 ,***1510145

99 OR EQUAL

99 OR EQUAL

02 QUILL

01 OFFICE DEPOT 825-190

03 C.LEONARD BC-05

04 BC50

04 BC20

05 OFFICE DEPOT 825182B (429-415)

06 SCHOOL SMART

07 IMPERIAL 1294-020

1510140

BINDER CLIPS, MEDIUM, 1 1/4", BOX OF 12 

,***1510140

1510135

BINDER CLIPS, SMALL, 3/4", BOX OF 12 CLIPS 

,***1510135

99 OR EQUAL

01 OFFICE DEPOT 825-182

02 QUILL

03 PYRAMID BC-02/1199660



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

39 3600

NO BID $0.40 10

11 UNIVERSAL P272220

12 FALCON PCJ

13 STANDARD PC6

14 OFFICE DEPOT 429-175

15 12920

06 A & W

07 REX

08 ASSOCIATED H4-02002

09 OFFICEMATE PCG/1007 (308-239)

10 CHARLES LEONARD 301E

01 SCOVILL #77

02 ACCO

03 NOESTING JUMBO

04 ABEL GIANT GEM

05 LION JUMBO

14 OD 10001 (308-478)

15 OFFICE DEPOT 429-266

16 OFFICEMATE 99911-PC1

1510155

CLIPS, PAPER, JUMBO, 100 PER BOX, 10/CTN 2" LENGTH 

,***1510155

99 OR EQUAL

08 OFFICEMATE PC1/308-478

09 CHARLES LEONARD 201E

10 SITICH C G1

12 STANDARD PC1

13 FALCON PCR

03 ACCO 72360

04 ABEL GEM #1

05 LION #1

06 A & W #1

07 ASSOCIATED 02001

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOVILL #71C

02 NOESTING #1



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

40 2400

NO BID $0.65 12

41 108

NO BID NO BID

42 300

NO BID $0.72 07

43 504

NO BID NO BID

06 CHAS LEONARD #89004

07 PYRAMID 1162403

08 OIC 83141 (174-276)

09 IMPERIAL 1272LG

1510170

COMPASS, ARC, W/HALF LENGTH PENCIL, ELEM. 

,***1510170

01 QUILL #705

02 A & W 40

03 ASSOCIATED 00205

04 STEMPEL 252

05 CASCADE F700205

01 UNV05610

02 IMPERIAL 1272MO

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

1510163

CLIPBOARD, LEGAL SIZE, 9" X 15 1/2", 1/4", 24/CTN 

,***1510163

99 OR EQUAL

09 OIC 83140 (991-992)

10 IMPERIAL 1272LR

11 STANDARDS 05612

12 PYRAMID 1162437

1510162

CLIPBOARD, 6" X 9", MASONITE ***1510162*

04 STEMPEL 251

05 CASCADE

06 OFFICEMATE 83100

07 CHAS LEONARD 89003

08 OFFICE DEPOT 991992

1510160

CLIPBOARD, LETTER SIZE, 9" X 12 1/2" MASONITE, 

1/4", 24/CTN ,***1510160

99 OR EQUAL

01 QUILL #704

02 A & W 39

03 ASSOCIATED 00204



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

44 600

NO BID $1.05 09

45 96

NO BID $0.50 99

46 3000

NO BID $0.35 99

PYRAMID 

1099241

PYRAMID 

1718998

99 OR EQUAL

01 SANFORD 81505

03 BAKER IN05

04 IMPERIAL 1360-5

05 CHALKBUSTER 2060

06 QUARTET ZENITH

1510235

ERASER, WHITE BOARD ,***1510235

12 IMPERIAL 1892BK

1510224

ERASER, BLACKBOARD, 5", DOUBLE STITCHED SIX STRIPS 

OF DENSE PREMIUM FELT INDIVIDU DOUBLE SEWN TO A 

BACKING FELT, SIZE 2" WI 1 5/16" DEEP, 5" LENGTH 
99 OR EQUAL

01 CASTELLO DOUBLE SEWED

02 ELGIN 5 " SPECIAL

07 CHAS LEONARD 900

08 STANDARD C-38

09 STATUS PLUS 1111582

10 SW 1892BK

11 SCHOOL SMART 040617

02 LION #15

03 TD-15

04 OFFICEMATE TD-15

05 ABEL TD10 **NO LONGER ACCEPTABLE

06 THREE M C 38

05 GENERAL G-591

06 IMPERIAL 13010

1510210

DISPENSER, TAPE, DESK MODEL, FOR 1" CORE 

,***1510210

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOTCH #C15

99 OR EQUAL

01 E. FABER CO #1756

02 STERLING

03 A & W #17007

04 REX 3813



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

47 2520

NO BID $0.59 99

49 360

NO BID $0.85 07

PYRAMID 

1718998

PYRAMID 

3570330

10 IMPERIAL 139-4

11 GENERAL 4RH

12 SCHOOL SMART 059952

13 IMPERIAL 13904

05 REX #4

06 ABEL RH4

07 CHARLES LEONARD 4RBP

08 UNIVERSAL V7-74113

09 CASCADE

1510253

FASTENERS, PAPER, ROUND HEAD #4, BRASS 1" LONG, 

100/BOX ,***1510253

01 ACCO #4

02 SCOVILL #4

03 NOESTING #4

04 A & W #4

08 IMPERIAL 13555

09 IMPERIAL 13675

10 STANDARD GEN G-100

11 OFFICE DEPOT ERPNK24 /279-632

12 SOUTHWEST Z13675

03 REMBRANDT #10

04 GENERAL 102

05 EASTMAN E-300

06 GENERAL 100E

07 FABER 70528

05 STANDARD T104

1510236

ERASER, PINK PEARL, MEDIUM SIZE 12 PER BOX 

,***1510236

99 OR EQUAL

01 EBERHARD FABER N6-100

02 DIXON

02 WHISPER KLEEN 5005*NOT ACCEPTABLE**

03 CHARLES LEONARD 74535

04 WHITEBOARD WIZARD 2020*NOT ACCEPTABLE**



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

50 240

NO BID $4.94 14

51 240

NO BID $5.92 05

52 960

NO BID $4.25 13

**TOPS/

OXFORD 

ESSELTE 

373 1/5   

5 BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

09 OFFICE DEPOT 543-271

1510286

FOLDER, MANILA, LETTER SIZE, 1/3 CUT, 11 POINT, 

100 PER BOX ,***1510286

99 OR EQUAL

01 GLOBE WEIS 21 1/3

04 DATACOM F120

05 OXFORD 752 1/2

06 SMEAD 152L

07 AMPAD 752 1/2

08 AMPAD 221 1/2

1510285

FOLDER MANILA, LETTER SIZE, 1/2 CUT, 100 PER BOX 

,***1510285

99 OR EQUAL

01 GLOBE WERNICKE 721-2

02 ATLAS 332

03 GLOBE WEIS 21 1/2

10 OFFICE DEPOT 811-018

11 DIVERSAFILE 4211-400

12 AMPAD 422 1/5

13 AMPAD 373 1/5

14 ESSELTE 373 1/5

05 DATACOM HF25T

06 OXFORD 91535/81622

07 SMEAD C15HRC

08 UNIVERSAL 14215

09 SMEAD C25H

99 OR EQUAL

01 OXFORD PENDAFLEX #4153

02 ASSOC. F1-C53-1/5

03 G W 422 1/5

04 SCM HF 151 NOT ACCEPTABLE (LETTER SIZE)

1510284

FOLDERS,HANGING-LEGAL 1/5 CUT 25 PER BOX 

,***1510284



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

53 360

NO BID $3.75 03

54 108

NO BID $5.92 04

55 252

NO BID $5.95 11

** 5 

BX/CS

** 10 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

08 AMPAD 221 1/5

09 OXFORD 50761

1510292

FOLDER, MANILA, LEGAL SIZE, 3RD CUT, 11 POINT, 100 

PER BOX ,***1510292

99 OR EQUAL

05 CASCADE

03 EASTMAN C115

04 OXFORD 752 1/5

05 UNIVERSAL 12115

06 SMEAD 155L

07 VERIFILE

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

1510288

FOLDER, MANILA, LETTER SIZE, 5TH CUT, 11 POINT, 

100 PER BOX ,***1510288

99 OR EQUAL

01 GLOBE WEIS 21 1/5

02 DATACOM F150

13 TOPPS 370 1/3

1510287

FOLDER, HANGING, LETTER SIZE, 1/5 CUT, STANDARD 

GREEN, 25 PER BOX

01 ESSELTE 372 1/5

02 OFFICE DEPOT 810-994

03 OXFORD 372 1/5

08 QUILL 740137

09 DIVERSIFILE #81-3000

10 AMPAD 753 1/3

11 AMPAD 221 1/3

12 ESSELTE 370 1/3

03 OXFORD ESSETT

04 OXFORD 752 1/3

05 UNIVERSAL 12113

06 SMEAD 10346

07 OXFORD 753 1/3

02 DATACOM F130



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

56 60

NO BID $7.64 06

57 1200

NO BID $3.29 07

58 840

NO BID $3.29 99

** 5 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

1510297

FOLDER, PORTFOLIO, RED, 25 PER BOX ***1510297

03 FILE EZ 80125

04 FILE EZ 80128 **NOT ACCEPTABLE

05 ESS57502

06 OXFORD 50754

07 ESSELTE 50762

09 AMPAD 222 1/5

1510296

FOLDER, PORTFOLIO, ROYAL BLUE, 25 PER BOX (5 BOXES 

PER CASE) ,***1510296

99 OR EQUAL

01 AMBERG #575

02 DUO-TANG #50-125-23

04 DATACOM F250

05 OXFORD ESSETT

06 OXFORD 753 1/5

07 SMEAD-OD 810895

08 OFFICE DEPOT 810903

1510294

FOLDER, MANILA, LEGAL SIZE, 5TH CUT, 11 POINT, 100 

PER BOX ,***1510294

99 OR EQUAL

01 GLOBE WERNICKE #722-5

02 ATLAS 345

03 GLOBE WEIS 22 1/5

06 OX ESSETT

08 SMEAD

09 DIVERSIFILE 92-3000

10 AMPAD 222 1/3

11 ESSELTE 371 1/3

07 OXFORD 753 1/3

01 GLOBE WERNICKE #722-3

02 ATLAS 343

03 GLOBE WEIS 22 1/3

04 DATACOM F230



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

59 1200

NO BID $3.29 07

60 660

NO BID $3.29 02

61 8208

NO BID $0.72 01

**ELMER

S MIN 

$750 

48/CS

62 300

NO BID $9.96 01

** 

OXFORD 

50752 5 

BX/CS

**5 

BX/CS

** 5 

BX/CS

** 2/CS

1510312

GLUE, WHITE, 4 OZ. SQUEEZE BTL. 48 PER 

CTN.***1510312

01 ELMERS E1322NR ** NO SUBSTITUTE **

1510314

GLUE, WHITE, GAL. 4 PER CTN.***1510314

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 ELMERS E1326R ***NO SUBSTITUTIONS ***

07 OXFORD 50761

1510299

FOLDER, PORTFOLIO, LIGHT GREEN, 25 PER BOX, 

***1510299

01 ESS57503

99 OR EQUAL

02 OXFORD 50753

01 AMBERG #575

02 DUO-TANG #50-125-70

03 SMEAD 486Y

04 FILE EZ 80125

05 FILE EZ 80128 *NOT ACCEPTABLE

01 ESS57511

99 OR EQUAL

1510298

FOLDER, PORTFOLIO, YELLOW, 25 PER BOX, (5 BOXES 

PER CASE) ,***1510298

99 OR EQUAL



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

63 3600

NO BID $0.30 99

64 1008

NO BID $0.30 99

65 1896

NO BID $1.37 03

** 

AVERY 

MIN 

$850 

AVERY 

11465  

48/CS 

** 

AVERY 

11466 

48/CS

1510396

CORRECTION, TAPE MONO SINGLE LINE DISPOSAL 394" 

LENGTH, WHITE ,***1510396

99 OR EQUAL

01 TOMBOW 68620

02 UNDO 04503*NOT ACCEPTABLE**

03 TOMBOW 68720 (PACKAGED 10 PER BOX)

14 SCHOOL SMART SSI 081940

1510334

INDEX, CLEAR PLASTIC TAB FIVE/SET, 2", 8 1/2" X 

11" SHEET ,***1510334

01 C12135C AVERY

02 AVERY 14566

99 NO SUBSTITUTIONS *******

09 WJ 54309

10 IMPERIAL 1115AD

11 CELUDEX FR-13

12 CENTIS YR-2135C

13 OFFICE DEPOT 315-465

04 G-W B5213 IS COLORED

05 ASSOC. #A1185-5

06 DENNISON 23-981

07 EASTMAN C 181-5

08 KLEERFAX 05119

1510333

INDEX, COLORED SEE THROUGH PLASTIC TAB 2", 8 1/2" 

X 11", 3 HOLE PUNCH, 5 DIVIDERS PER SET, 

,***1510333

99 OR EQUAL

01 AICO #S-13

02 AVERY 14608

03 G-W B5213C IS CLEAR NOT COLORED

** MIN 

ORDER 

400 

EACH IN 

FULL CS  

8 PK/CS 

(80 

EACH)



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

67 96

NO BID $14.95 01

68 204

NO BID $0.92 01

69 408

NO BID $0.92 11

05 SPIRIT ASSOCIATED C911C

08 PAPERMATE 966-01 ** NO SUB **

09 PAPERMATE 85588

10 PAPERMATE 6160187

11 BIC GSF

10 PAPERMATE COMFORTMATE 6180187

11 PAPER MATE 3381131

1510477

PEN BALL POINT, FINE BLUE ,***1510477

01 BIC #PF39

02 LONGLIFE F336

02 LONGLIFE F336

03 FABER 7600 SPIRIT

05 SPIRIT ASSOC. C991C

08 PAPERMATE 968-01 **NO SUB**

09 PAPERMATE 85587 (524-992)

03 UNICK 1004351-0 (632-848)

04 OD1025 625-848

05 OD1001/430-074

1510475

PEN, BALL POINT, FINE, BLACK, ,***1510475

01 BIC #PF39

04 PAPERMATE LIQ. PAPER 06604

1510421

PICTURE FRAMES, 8 1/2 X 11", PACK OF 3, BLACK 

PLASTIC. ,***1510421

99 OR EQUAL

01 NU-DELL

02 DAX-N1700N

** MIN 

ORDER 

400 

EACH IN 

FULL CS  

8 PK/CS 

(80 

EACH)

NUDELL 

11888

BIC 

PF39 

(GSF11)



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

70 408

NO BID $1.79 99

71 1104

$2.11 11 $0.86 13

72 804

NO BID $6.95 08

73 408

NO BID

NO BID

74 708

NO BID $6.95 08

36 DZ 

PER 

CASE

1510496

PEN, BALL POINT, MEDIUM, RED ,***1510496

08 PAPERMATE 962-01 **NO SUB**

1510494

PEN, BALL POINT, MEDIUM, GREEN, ,***1510494

02 LONGLIFE

05 FABER CAS (ASSOC C950C)

08 PAPERMATE 614-01

09 PAPERMATE 334-11

13 PAP3331131

14 BIC GSM

15 PAPERMATE GRIP OFFICE DEPOT SKU 863173

1510492

PEN, BALL POINT, MEDIUM, BLUE ,***1510492

08 PAPERMATE 961-01 **NO SUB**

08 PAPERMATE 963-01

09 SANFORD SAGA 52011

10 PAPERMATE CONFORTMATE 6130187

11 BIC SOFTFEEL 11BK

12 PAPERMATE 85585 (524-968)

09 PAP6170187

10 SCHOOL SMART 077236

11 SCHOOL SMART SSI 038163

1510490

PEN, BALL POINT, MEDIUM, BLACK ,***1510490

05 FABER CAS (ASSC C990C)

1510479

PEN BALL POINT, FINE, RED ,***1510479

01 BIC #PF39

02 LONGLIFE F336

05 SPIRIT ASSOC. C931C

08 PAPERMATE 85591

BIC 

GSFG11



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

75 360

$1.99 14 $1.89 14

76 96

$1.99 10 $1.89 10

77 120

$1.99 10 $1.89 10

36 PER 

CASE

03 MAGIC 200

02 FLING 7722

04 WEAREVER 721RF

08 SANFORD PAPERMATE 38013

09 EBERHARD 38013

10 LIQUIMARK 11203 (36 PER CASE)

1510516

PEN, MARKING, FINE, RED, WASHABLE MUST BE 

CERTIFIED NON TOXIC ,***1510516

01 VENUS ESTERBROOK

03 WEAREVER 721 BF

04 PENN X-90MP

05 BEROL N2-7702

06 PAPERMATE BY GILLETTE

07 FABER CASTELL

13 EBERHARD FABER 38011

14 LIQUI-MARK 11201

1510512

PEN, MARKING, MED., BLUE, WASHABLE **NON TOXIC 

LABEL** ,***1510512

01 VENUS ESTERBROOK

02 FLING 7702

08 EBERHARD FABER COLORBRITE

09 BEROL

10 VENUS FABER CASTEL 61011

11 DIXON TREND 81170

12 SANFORD 380XX

03 MAGIC 200

04 WEAREVER 721KF

05 PENN X-90MP

06 BINNEY & SMITH CRAYOLA

07 PRANG

1510510

PEN, MARKING, FINE, BLACK, WASHABLE NON 

TOXIC.,FLEX. FELT TIP ,***1510510

01 VENUS ESTERBROOK

02 FLING 7735

36 PER 

CASE

36 PER 

CASE



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

79 96

$2.19 99 $5.95 15

81 300

N $5.76 01

82 120

$3.24 99 $3.95 06

06 SANFORD FABER 60143

01 PENTEL #R106

02 WEAREVER 745

03 BIC RF-11

04 PENN-RBX90

05 EASTMAN E120

15 SAN37003

1510528

PEN, PERMANENT MARKER, BLACK, STANDARD SHARPIE 

***1510528
01 SHARPIE 30001 BK ***NO SUB ***

1510531  PEN, ROLLER WRITER, FINE, BLACK 

,***1510531

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

10 FABER N2C701

11 DIXON TREND 81181

12 FABER 60203/NEW 33043

13 PAPER MATE FLAIR 8310152

14 SHARPIE 3700BE

05 WEAREVER #741BF

06 BIC UF BE

07 BEROL N2 F32BE

08 GILLETTE PAPERMATE

09 VENUS FABER CASTELL 2133

1510522

PEN, MARKING, SUPERFINE, BLUE MUST BE CERTIFIED 

NON TOXIC ,***1510522

01 LONGLIFE 550

02 VENUS

03 BIC XFL39

04 PENN X-90EFP

07 FABER 61012/NEW 38012

08 DIXON TREND 38012/81110

09 SANFORD PAPERMATE 38012

10 LIQUIMARK 11207 (36 PER CASE)

11 MONAMI PLUS 3000

05 BEROL N2-7722

06 GILLETTE PAPERMATE
36 PER 

CASE

LIQUIMA

RK 

17121  

36 DZ 

PER 

CASE

LIQUIMA

RK 

14121  

36 DZ 

PER CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

83 96

$3.24 99 $3.95 06

 

 

84 4800

$0.74 99 $0.83 08

85 6708

NO BID $1.21 03

86 1008

NO BID $1.45 01

03 DIXON PRANG 80680

04 LIQUIMARK**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

1510552

MARKERS, WATERCOLOR, PASTEL (SOFT & LIGHT 

WASHABLE, LARGE BULLET TIP (24 BOX PER 

CASE)***1510552                                                            

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

10 COLOR-BRITE SSS361112

1510550

MARKERS, WATERCOLOR, WASHABLE, BOX OF 8 BULLET 

TIP, LG.(24 PER CASE

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 B & S 7808

02 PRANG 80580

05 BN 4012

06 SAN FABER 01112

07 RAINBOW RITER 5012**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

08 CHARLES LEONARD 67512

09 DIXON 20270

99 OR EQUAL

01 VENUS #26602

02 GENERAL 700-

03 DIXON 341 *NEW #22120

04 FABER - CASTEL 266002

03 BIC RF-11

04 FABER 60245

05 FABER 60145

06 SANFORD 60145

1510533

PENCIL, COLOR 12 ASSORTED PER SET MINIMUM 3.3 MM 

,***1510533

1510532

PEN, ROLLER WRITER, FINE, BLUE ,***1510532

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 PENTEL #R106

02 WEAREVER 745

LIQUIMA

RK 

14123  

36 DZ 

PER CS

MONTROS

E #CPB-

12     

CASE PK 

OF 

144/12 

PK 

** 

CRAYOLA 

MIN 

$550 

24/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

87 20004

$0.69 99 $0.59 08

90 120

NO BID $0.69 04

91 600

NO BID $25.69 05

92 420

NO BID $1.39 07

MONTROS

E #PB-

12  120 

DZ PER 

CASE

01 VENUS #2116

99 OR EQUAL

05 XACTO BOSTON SCHOOL PRO 1670

99 ** NO SUBSTITUTIONS **

1510578

PENCIL SET, COPY COLOR WATER SOLUBLE, 7" , 12 

COLORS, PLASTIC BOX, TEACHERS USE ONLY ,***1510578

99 OR EQUAL

01 SANFORD 83019 (PKG OF 5)

02 POINTE 20051 (PKG OF 5)

03 BAUCE2600 (PKG OF 6) **UNACCEPTABLE

04 LEONARD 80805 (PKG OF 5)

1510577

PENCIL SHARPENER, WITH SELECTOR WHEEL, ELECTRIC 

AUTO RESET, #1510577 COMPACT DESIGN NONSKID FEET.

07 DIXON 14402 * NOT ACCEPTABLE

08 MUSGRAVE PROSPECTOR #2

09 DIXON 12872

1510576  PENCIL GRIPS PKG OF 5, ASSORTED COLORS 

SOFT FOAM FOR A COMFORTABLE GRIP

99 OR EQUAL

02 FABER-CASTELL #1492

03 GENERAL 310

04 FABER CASTELL 210-2

05 DIXON ORIOLE 287-2

06 FABER 12132

02 LIQUIMARK**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

03 CRA58-7816

1510555

PENCIL, #2, WITH ERASER, WOOD CASE ONLY * NO SUBS* 

(120 DOZ PER CASE) ,***1510555

99 OR EQUAL

01 DIXON EXECUTIVE #402

01 B & S 7816

** 

CRAYOLA 

MIN 

$550 

24/CS

SARGENT 

22-7204  

72 

SET/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

93 900

$0.52 99 $0.55 11

95 96

NO BID $1.09 99

LIQUIMA

RK 

63712    

144 EA 

PER 

CASE  

PKS OF 

12

07 CREATIVITY STREET / OD717-599

08 OFFICE DEPOT #295982 100/PACK

09 3620WE LEONARD

SOUTHWEST SCHOOL SUPPLY10 IMPERIAL 3620WE

02 BERRY 7110-U

03 BARRY 7112

04 STANDARD 7112-WH BAG

05 STANDARD 7112-WH

06 SCHOOL SMART 085861

11 SARGENT 22-7214

12 SCHOLASTIC SFTC-PL-12S

1510595  PIPE CLEANERS, WHITE, 100 PER BOX/BAG 

,***1510595

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 7112 WH

06 BEROL 928EM

07 RAINBOW RITERS**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

08 INNOKIDS**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

09 COLOR SPLASH SC968

10 B&S 68-4112

01 VENUS 25534

02 FABER 019-8R

03 DIXON 10512

04 FABER 25615 (12 COLOR SET)

05 FABER N5-25534

06 SANFORD 10122

07 SARGENT 227203/22-7204

08 BINNEY 68-4302

1510580

PENCIL SET,12 COLOR, 3 1/2" LENGTH *MUST BE 

DELIVERED IN FULL CASES* ,***1510580

99 OR EQUAL

02 DIXON 2250 *NEW #11129

03 COL-ERASE 1200-12

04 GENERAL 700AP

05 FABER 23502

SARGENT 

22-7204  

72 

SET/CS

72 

SET/CS

LOEANRD 

65435



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

96 96

NO BID $1.59 05

97 600

NO BID $11.50 01

98 840

NO BID $8.64 01

** 18 

PKGS/CS

99 408

NO BID $3.74 01

** 36 

PKGS/CS

100 900

NO BID $1.51 01

1510606

POST IT NOTE, LINED, 4 X 6 YELLOW CANARY YELLOW 

WHSE - ISSUE IS EACH (ONE)*** ,***1510606

01 3M 660YW

99 NO SUBSTITUTIONS ***

99 NO SUBS***

1510602

POST-IT-NOTES, 3 X 3", YELLOW, 12 PER PKG *** WHSE 

- ISSUE IS 12 PER PACKAGE*** ,***1510602

01 SCOTCH, 3M #654 ***NO SUB***

1510603

POST-IT-NOTE, 1 1/2" X 2", YELLOW, 12/PKG *** WHSE 

- ISSUE IS 12 IN A PACKAGE*** ,***1510603

01 SCOTCH, 3M #653 ***NO SUB***

05 AAKRON AA15

06 STANDARD D105

1510601

POST IT NOTES, 3"X 3" NEON COLORS 12 PER PKG: NEON 

PINK,ORANGE,GREEN WATERMELON. 100 SHEETS PER 

PAD,***1510601

01 3M 654 NEON ***NO SUBS***

02 3M 654 NEON-BONUS PACK OF 14 **NO SUBS***

99 OR EQUAL

01 G W SCHOOL SUPPLY #D105

02 WESTCOTT D105

03 ACME D105

04 FALCON 15

1510600

POINTERS, BLACKBOARD, RUBBER TIPPED, 36" 

,***1510600

AAKRON 

AA15 

(100015

)

** 3M 

MIN 12 

PKS/CS

** 

72/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

101 17520

NO BID $0.44 01

**AVERY 

144/CS

102 17520

NO BID $0.44 01

** 

144/CS

103 5004

NO BID $0.44 01

** 

144/CS

104 7008

NO BID $0.44 01

** 

144/CS

105 660

NO BID $6.96 99 /01

84001 

DISC. 

86001 

RPLCMNT

01 DENNISON 24-405 *** NO SUB ***

1510615

MARKER, DRY ERASE, BLACK 12 PER BOX FINE POINT,NON-

TOXIC ,***1510615

99 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

01 EXPO/SANFORD 84001 **NO SUBSTITUTES**

1510612

MARKER, DRY ERASE-BLUE, FOR USE ON WHITE MARKER 

BOARD *** NON TOXIC MUST HAVE AP/CP SEAL AND CHOKE 

PROOF CAP ,***1510612

01 DENNISON 24-406 *** NO SUB ***

1510613

MARKER, DRY ERASE - RED, FOR USE ON WHITE MARKER 

BOARD *** NON TOXIC *** MUST HAVE AP/CP SEAL AND 

CHOKE PROOF CAP ,***1510613

01 DENNISON 24-407 *** NO SUB ***

1510614

MARKER, DRY ERASE-GREEN, FOR USE ON WHITE MARKER 

BOARD MUST HAVE AP/CP SEAL AND CHOKE PROOF CAP 

,***1510614

1510611

MARKER, DRY ERASE-BLACK, CHISEL TIP, FOR USE ON 

WHITE MARKER BOARD ***NON TOXIC MUST HAVE AP/CP 

SEAL AND CHOKE PROOF CAP ,***1510611

01 AVERY DENNISON - 24408 ***NO SUB ***



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

107 84

NO BID $9.36 12

#120159

9

108 360

NO BID $0.44 12

109 72

NO BID $1.89 03

09 C LEONARD 90001

10 GENERAL G1

11 SCHOOL SMART 039423

12 PYRAMID 1111160

1510639

RECEIPT BOOK, ONE ON A PAGE, TRIPLICATE 

,***1510639

04 REX 3816

05 ABLE

06 ROGER

07 IMPERIAL 1676

08 OFFICE MATE H2HP1

1510630

PUNCH, HAND, 5", 1/4" ROUND ,***1510630

99 OR EQUAL

01 B2600-5

02 MCGILL H2-403R

03 A & W 1225 NC

10 POWER PUNCH 1501 *NOT ACCEPTABLE**

11 CHAS LEONARD 90300

12 STATUS PLUS 41-024 (1111178)

13 OFFICE DEPOT 427-151 ***UNACCEPTABLE ***

14 SCHOOL SMART SSI 038174

05 HUNT 74250

06 HUNT 1501

07 ACCO 74300

08 CLINE 90300

09 IMPERIAL 1672-3

99 OR EQUAL

01 CENTAMATIC MULTIPLE #300

02 ACCO 300/H2-74250

03 WILSON 271 1/2

04 ACCO #74250 ***NO LONGER ACCEPTABLE***

1510628

PUNCH, DESK MODEL, ADJUSTABLE 2 OR 3 HOLE 

,***1510628



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

110 240

NO BID $3.95 02

111 60

NO BID $0.52 99

112 408

NO BID $0.62 99

08 CARDINAL C16RB-14

03 WESTTRADE

04 REVERE

05 R & D RUBBER

06 ABEL 200

07 ABLE #16

07 BRACHTEL WPW200 SELF ADHESIVE

1510654

RUBBER BANDS, 1/4 LB BOX, SIZE 16 ,***1510654

99 OR EQUAL

01 B F GOODRICH

02 ALLIANCE "ECO"

02 DENNISON #52-102

03 REYBURN 52-102

04 52-144

05 AVERY A5ETD909

06 SURE STICK PS-200

04 E. FABER 200-16-1/4

05 HAZTC1182

1510650

REINFORCEMENTS, GUMMED, 1/4" HOLE, 12 CTN 

,***1510650

99 OR EQUAL

01 ACE

1510641

RECEIPT BOOK, FOUR ON A PAGE, 12 X 8 1/2" 

TRIPLICATE ,***1510641

99 OR EQUAL

01 REDIFORM #8K808

02 TOPS/ADAMS TC1182

03 TOPS 46808

99 OR EQUAL

01 REDIFORM #8K802

02 TOPS 45802

03 ADAMS TC2701

04 HAZTC2701

LEONARD 

91200

PYRAMID 

1740224



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

113 408

NO BID $0.62 99

114 240

NO BID $0.62 99

07 ABEL 200

08 ABLE #64

09 CARDINAL C64RB-14

10 OFFICE MATE RB-R-64

11 ASSOCIATED A6-90113

01 B F GOODRICH #N1-464

02 PLYMOUTH #P64 1/4

04 REMBRANDT

05 REVERE

06 R & D RUBBER

13 GENERAL

14 IMPERIAL 172018

1510658

RUBBER BANDS, 1/4 LB BOX, SIZE 64 ,***1510658

99 OR EQUAL

03 ALLIANCE ECO

08 ABEL 200-18

09 CARDINAL C18RB-14

10 OFFICE MATE RB-R-18

11 ASSOCIATED A6-90103

12 SCHMERHHORN

03 ALLIANCE ECO

04 HUDSON 19

05 WESTTRADE 18

06 REVERE

07 R & D RUBBER

13 IMPERIAL 172016

1510656

RUBBER BANDS, 1/4 LB BOX, SIZE 18 ,***1510656

99 OR EQUAL

01 B F GOODRICH #N1-418

02 PLYMOUTH P18 1/4

09 OFFICEMATE RB-R-16

10 SCHMERHORN

11 GENERAL

12 OFFICE DEPOT 2416808 / 856-198

PYRAMID 

3646700

PYRAMID 

3646726



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

115 1608

NO BID $0.25 04

100204

116 5580

NO BID $0.13 99

117 3840

NO BID $0.20 08

04 ACME 240-C

05 FALLON H3-F240S5

1510682

SCISSORS, 5", BLUNT, AMBIDEXTROUS ,***1510682

99 OR EQUAL

01 ACME KLEENCUT #340-C

02 WESTRADE

03 ACME 105-240-S-5

07 FISKARS 8772

08 NINBRO 033843

09 ODRTP-003608-OP-087-05 720-461

10 STANDARD 16220

11 IMPERIAL 1760CR

02 ACME R-410-12

03 FALCON 71-12

04 A & W 36012

05 LEONARD 77412

06 GENERAL 16220

04 AAKRON AA204

05 STANDARDS 2304-12

1510665

RULER, PLASTIC, ONE SIDE INCHES DOWN TO 16THS, 

OTHER SIDE METRIC (CM/MM). ,***1510665

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 WESTCOTT

1510664

RULER, WOOD, 1/4" SCALE, 12" ,***1510664

99 OR EQUAL

01 WESTCOTT #R130-12

02 ACME R130-12

03 FALCON 2304-12

12 ROGERS

13 WESTTRADE

14 GENERAL

15 OFFICE DEPOT 2464808 / 856-657

16 IMPERIAL 172064

PYRAMID 

111558

** ACME 

MIN 

$500



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

118 1704

NO BID $0.20 99

120 4800

NO BID $0.64 03

121 2400

NO BID $0.43 11

122 600

NO BID $0.19 08

99 OR EQUAL

09 STANDARDS 2100

10 FALCON FBTBSV-8

11 ACME 40618

12 IMPERIAL 178458

1510708

STAPLE REMOVER ,***1510708

04 ROGERS **NO LONGER ACCEPTABLE

05 FALCON FST8 **NO LONGER ACCEPT

06 SNIPPY B848 STAINLESS STEEL ONLY

07 LEONARD 75812 (1174853)

08 FALCON FB+BS-8

1510690

SCISSORS, 8" LENGTH, OFFICE USE ,***1510690

99 OR EQUAL

01 ACME #101-8**NO LONGER ACCEPTABLE

02 GLOBE WEIS #111-8 ** NO LONGER

03 OFFICE MATE FCS-8 **NO LONGER ACC

02 IMPERIAL 1783S5

1510688

NOTEBOOK, WIREBOUND, COLLEGE RULED, 8.5 X 11", 1 

SUBJECT,70- 80 SHEETS, ***1510688

01 RED33709_BULK

03 TOPS 65022

04 IMPERIAL 1157070C

09 SPR39045

10 GENERAL E9416

1510684

SCISSORS, 5" SEMI SHARP, AMBIDEXTROUS ***1510684*

99 OR EQUAL

01 GENERAL E9430

06 IMPERIAL 1783S5

07 STANDARD 9430

08 ACME 42515

** ACME 

MIN 

$500

** ACME 

42515 

360/CS

** 

24/CS

** 

144/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

123 2400

NO BID $0.40 99

124 900

NO BID $3.25  06

125 60

NO BID $22.68 01

06 BOSTITCH #440

10 BOSTITCH B440

11 ***NO SUBSTITUTES ***

1510717

ELECTRIC STAPLER,BLACK LOAD FULL STRIP OF STANDARD 

STAPLES STAPLES TO 25 SHEETS 20 LB BOND PAPER 2 

YEAR LIMITED WARRANTY ,***1510717

09 STANDARD STBC

10 BOSTON 73785B (1520717)

11 OFFICE DEPOT 207-902

12 IMPERIAL 18305

1510716

STAPLER, DESK TYPE, BLACK OR,GREY (NOTE FOR WHSE 

36 PER CASE) ,***1510716

04 OFFICEMATE SE-1

05 BATES STBC

06 ***LEONARD #84500-NOT ACCEPTABLE

07 SPARTAN S100

08 OFFICEMATE 10900

1510714

STAPLES, STANDARD, FOR ALL STANDARD STAPLERS, 5000 

PER BOX ,***1510714

99 OR EQUAL

01 SWINGLINE #SF-1

02 BOSTITCH SBS-19 1/4 CP

03 ABEL

05 OFFICEMATE SRA

06 LEONARD 050/92420

07 GENERAL 32002

08 STATUS PLUS 66-008 (1111384)

09 IMPERIAL 18360

01 ACE #600

02 BOSTITCH G-600

03 ASSOCIATED 01600

04 QUALITY LINES 22

PYRAMID 

3652393

** 

BOSTICK 

MIN 

$500 

36/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990
** 6/CS

126 216

NO BID $1.49 02

127 540

NO BID $1.73 03

128 804

NO BID $2.79 07

129 96

NO BID $4.06 12

06 AMERICAN

07 APC APS2410

1510762

TABLET, JUNIOR LEGAL, CANARY, 12 PER PKG 

PERFORATED ONLY, NO SUBS  ,***1510762

01 NIFTY 9250

02 PENWORTHY 250-1

03 BEMISS JASON 7461

04 PACON 9707 / 74610

05 RIVERSIDE

03 FELLOWES 00703 W/ATTACHED LID

04 BOISE E500703

05 PERMA 03325 **NOT ACCEPTABLE**

1510760

TABLET, CHART, RULED, 24 X 32", 2 HOLE PUNCH, 1" 

RULED, SPIRAL BOUND ,***1510760

99 OR EQUAL

02 EUREKA 824020-AI (173-575)

1510757

STORAGE BOX, SMALL WITH ATTACHED LIDS, 15 X 12 X 

10 *MUST BE PACKAGED 12 PER BOX**** ,***1510757

99 OR EQUAL

01 BANKERS BOX #772

02 OC725 **LID NOT ATTACHED/NOT ACCEP

01 STANLEY BOSTITCH 02210

02 SWINGLINE 10105P *NOT ACCEPTABLE **

1510752

STARS, 1/2" ASSORTED COLORS SELF ADHESIVE,440 

STARS PER PACK ,***1510752

99 OR EQUAL

01 AVERY 6007

99 OR EQUAL

** MIN 

ORDER 

864 

EACH IN 

PALLET 

INCREME

NTS 

288/PAL

LET

** MIN 

OF 804 

EACH 

12/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

130 96

NO BID $8.89 07

131 372

NO BID $35.10 01

**

132 1080

NO BID $1.74 01

01 3M 559 * NO SUBS *

1510768

CLEAR 2" PACKING TAPE W/ DISPENSER 2" X 22 1/5 

YARD ,***1510768

99 OR EQUAL

06 RIVERSIDE 03321

07 TOPS 7572

08 UNV 10630

09 QUILL 740022L

1510765

SELF STICK PLAIN EASEL PADS 25" X 30 1/2" CARTON 

OF 2 PADS ,***1510765

04 CASCADE

01 AMPAD P3-20-230

02 ASSOCIATED P3-C814CP

03 PRUDENTIAL FELDCO 22225

05 MEAD 59612

12 TOPS 7501

13 AMPAD OXFORD 20-264

14 OFFICE DEPOT 99421/307-397

1510764

TABLET, LEGAL, CANARY, 8 1/2 X 14" PERFORATED 

ONLY, NO SUB. ,***1510764

99 OR EQUAL

07 ASSOCIATED C58C

08 MEAD 59614

09 RIVERSIDE 03325

10 IMPERIAL 5970CY58

11 QUILL 253-742332

02 BOISE P3-C58CP

03 PRUDENTIAL FEIDCO 22221

04 CASCADE

05 EVERETT

06 QUALITY PARK 31242

99 OR EQUAL

01 AMPAD P3-20-264

** 72 

RLS/CS

** 12 

PKGS/CS

** 6 

PKGS/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

134 504

NO BID $3.18 01

135 4680

NO BID $1.69 01

** 

144/CS

136 72

NO BID $3.82 01

137 96

NO BID $0.64 13

12 SHURTAPE CP106/ECONOMY GRADE/NOT ACCEPTABLE***

13 MMM 2600-1/2

07 LEPAGE 1279

08 ANCHOR 519

09 SHUFORD CR-83

10 SHURTAPE CP83

11 AMERICAN PG 500

02 SCOTCH #232 BULK PKG

03 MYSTIC 275B

04 MMM 2600-1/2

05 ROTEX 6231 1/2

06 ARMAK #PG-505

04 TA 1204

05 SHURTAPE PP919

1510782

TAPE, MASKING, 1/2" X 60 YDS, 3" CORE MULT. OF 72 

,***1510782

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOTCH #202 INDIVIDUAL BOXED ROLLS

1510780

TAPE, 3 INCH CORE, MAGIC MENDING 3/4X 2592 MULT. 

OF 48 ,***1510780

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOTCH #810-34-25

02 LEPAGE #3004

03 LEPAGE 6400

1510774

TAPE, DOUBLE COATED, 1/2" X 900" ,***1510774

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOTCH #665  MMM66512900

1510778

TAPE, SCOTCH TAPE 3/4" X 36 YARDS 1" CORE 

,***1510778

01 SCOTCH 3-M 810-3/4-36 *NO SUBSTITUTION **

01 3M 142-B

02 OFFICE DEPOT 444970 - SCOTCH 3M 142-B
** 72 

RLS/CS

**72 

RLS/CS

** 

48/CS

** 

72/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

138 708

NO BID $0.81 10

139 408

$1.95 99 $2.14 02

140 1200

$2.30 99 $2.84 01

141 480

$4.90 99 $5.68 01

LEPAGES 

11073 

24 RLS 

PER 

CASE 

1.88" x 

60 Yds

ATLAS 

MT-835-

1.55 48 

RLS/CS

ATLAS 

MT-835-

2.55 24 

RLS/CS

01 MMM2090 - 1"

99 OR EQUAL

1510790

TAPE, PAINTERS BLUE MASKING, 2" X 60 YDS, 

***1510790

01 MMM 2090-2"

99 OR EQUAL

99 OR EQUAL

01 SHURTAPE CP66

02 3M 2600

03 SHURTAPE CP-106**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

1510788

TAPE, PAINTERS BLUE MASKING,1"X 60 YDS, ***1510788

06 ROTEX 6231-3/4

07 AMERICAN PG 500

09 SHURTAPE CP-101

10 3M HIGHLAND 2600

1510786

TAPE, MASKING 2"  CONTRACTOR GRADE 2 X 60 YARDS 

,***1510786

02 SCOTCH #232 BULK PKG

03 MYSTIC 275B

08 ANCHOR 519

04 ARMAX PG5 BULK PACK

05 3M HIGHLAND

1510784

TAPE, MASKING, 3/4" X 60 YDS, 3" CORE MULT. OF 48 

,***1510784

99 OR EQUAL

01 SCOTCH #202 INDIVIDUAL BOXED ROLLS

** 

48/CS

** 

24/CS

** 

36/CS

** 

24/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

142 60

NO BID NO BID

143 360

NO BID $1.79 01

145 144

NO BID $23.35 01

** 5 

BX/CS

ATLAS 

MT-835-

2.55 24 

RLS/CS

01 AVERY 5160  ***NO SUBSTITUTES

07 LEONARD 77565

08 OFFICE DEPOT NB20110508/502-325

09 ACM10425

10 SCHOOLSMART 081900

1630602

LASER ADDRESS LABEL, 1" X 2 5/8" BOX OF 3000, 

PERMANENT, WHITE 30 LABELS PER SHEET NO SUBS 

ACCEPTED* ,***1630602

02 AAKRON 700420

03 FALCON 82R (NOT ACCEPTABLE)

04 ACME R610-B (NOT ACCEPTABLE)

05 AAKRON 420B

06 FALCON 72 (277-004)

08 WINNE

09 PACON 09011 361-467

1510836

YARDSTICK, METAL EYELET ENDS ,***1510836

99 OR EQUAL

01 WESCOTT #R610B

03 ESSEX

04 BLUE MOUNTAIN

05 SCHERMERHORN

06 ZELPACO

07 ARMAK PG500**NOT ACCEPTABLE**

02 #819358 SCOTCHBLUE PAINTERS TAPE 2" BY 60 YD.

1510810

TWINE, 8 PLY, WHITE COTTON, 2 LB CONE ,***1510810

99 OR EQUAL

01 CONTINENTAL WESTERN

02 BEMEX

** 

24/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

146 360

NO BID $7.01 01

148 120

NO BID $120.40 01

** MIN 

ORDER 

10 BXS

149 48

NO BID $1.69 09

150 36

NO BID $1.69 07

** 

36/CS

151 708

NO BID $0.80 01

152 204 DOZ

$2.39 99 $2.52 05

LIQUIMA

RK 

91201 

36 

DZ/CS

6510480

PEN, MARKING, BLACK,  PERMANENT, CHISEL POINT. NOT 

FOR CLASSROOM USE ,***6510480

01 CARTERS MARKS-A-LOT #08888

02 PENN X-90P

03 PENN X90-12B

6510402

CORRECTION FLUID, MULTIPURPOSE QUICK DRY, 20-22 ML 

BOTTLE SPILL RESISTANT BOTTLE ,***6510402

99 OR EQUAL

01 PAP5640115

02 BIC WOFQDP

03 NO SUBSTITUTES

07 AVERY CARTER, NEAT FLO AVE 21447 ***NO 

SUBSTITUTES

6510367

INK, RED, STAMP PAD, 2 OZ NOT FOR CLASSROOM USE, 

DAB ON APPLICATOR, VENDOR MUST SUPPLY MSDS 

SHEET***6510367

1630608

LABEL, RAPTOR, 2 1/4" X 4" WHITE, NON-FADING INK, 

DYMO 30857 COMPATIBLE, 2500 BOX (10 ROLLS 250 EA) 

* * * 1630608

01 SPARTAN INDUSTRIAL ATK PREMIUM BRANDS - AMAZON

6510365

INK, BLACK, STAMP PAD, 2 OZ NOT FOR CLASSROOM USE, 

DAB ON APPLICATOR, VENDOR MUST SUPPLY MSDS SHEET 

**** 6510365

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

09 AVERY CARTER, NEAT FLO AVE 21448 - NO 

SUBSTITUTES -

1630604

LABEL, ADDRESS FOR LASER PRINTER, 2 5/8" X 1", 750 

LABELS PER PACKAGE ,***1630604

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 AVERY #5260  ***NO SUBSTITUTES

02 MACO ***NOT ACCEPTABLE
** 5 

BX/CS

** 

36/CS

** 

AVERY 

MIN  

12DZ/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

153 408

$1.17 99 $2.19 01

154 108

NO BID $1.49 09

155 108

NO BID $1.49 07

LIQUIMA

RK 

91201 

36 

DZ/CS

LIQUIMA

RK 

17400  

144 

SET/CS

03 SANFORD 95102

04 CARTER 21-371

99 OR EQUAL

01 CARTERS #1071

02 SANFORD R2-100-RD

04 CARTER 21-381

05 CARTER 21-381

06 DENNISON / AVERY #21081(FELT)

07 CARTER 21081 FELT

08 DENNISON 21-361**NOT ACCEPTABLE

6510700

STAMP PAD, BLACK, 3 X 4 1/2", SIZE 1, FELT ONLY 

*** NOT FOR CLASSROOM USE *** ,***6510700

99 OR EQUAL

01 CARTER #1282

02 SANFORD R2-100 BK

03 SANFORD 95101

10 FABER

6510486

MARKER, PERM/FINE PT 4 COLOR RED,BLACK,GREEN,BLUE 

PEN STYLE,QUICK DRY,VINYL POUCH AP CERTIFIED NON 

TOXIC ,***6510486

99 OR EQUAL

01 SANFORD SHARPIE 30074

02 SANFORD 30174

06 REMBRANDT P131

07 FABER CASTELL 3000-NOT ACCEPTABLE

08 FABER N264291

09 DIXON 95007

04 GENERAL 500G

09 LEONARD 92420

6510702

STAMP PAD, RED, 3 X 4 1/2", SIZE 1 FELT ONLY *** 

NO SUB *** NOT FOR CLASSROOM USE,***6510702

05 CARTER 27-178 ***NO SUB***

** 

AVERY 

MIN  

12DZ/CS



LN Qty Unit
OFFICE 

SOLUTIONS
BRAND

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

BRAND
Description/Product ID

1420990

TAPE, BOOK, TRANSPARENT, 2"WX540"L, ,***1420990

156 8820

NO BID $0.21 08

157 1920

$1.09 99 $1.48 01

LIQUIMA

RK 

41580 

144 

SET/CS

01 AVERY 24063

09 OFFICE DEPOT 128-844

10 SCHOOL SMART SSI 1354259

11 BAZIC 2332

6511031

HIGHLIGHTER, 4 COLOR SET FLUORESCENT/CHISEL TIP. 

YELLOW,PINK, GREEN AND ORANGE ,***6511031

99 OR EQUAL

04 DENNISON

05 FABER N264326

06 DIXON 47025 - DISCONTINUED**

07 LIQUIMARK 51208 *NOT ACCEPTABLE**

08 SAN64324

6511029

HIGHLITER, YELLOW VENDOR MUST PROVIDE MATERIAL 

SAFETY DATA SHEET. ****,***6511029

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

01 CARTER

02 SANFORD N2 25005

03 LONGLIFE 625-YE

05 DENNISON #21-371

06 CARTER 21071 FELT

07 LEONARD 92430

** MIN 

ORDER 

4896 

EACH

IN FULL 

CASES 

288/CS

** 36 

SETS/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$5.78 04 $4.90 04 $3.53 04

8452/3M

$8.46 04 $7.46 04 $5.35 04

$3.73 99 NO BID $3.85 03

$1.30 99 $1.14 99 $0.95 10

24/CS

124867 

COASTWI

DE

739302/

QUILL



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.85 99 $1.76 99 $2.79 11

12/CS

NO BID NO BID $3.03 04

NO BID NO BID $6.10 06

739502 

QUILL

SCHOOL 

SMART 

086373



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID $3.34 08

$10.87 99 $0.91 99 $7.08 99

$184.84 02 NO BID NO BID

SBNW/QU

ILL

2801400

/GBC

SCHOOL 

SMART 

085292

IMPERIA

L 

116080P

K  (4 

per pk)



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.89 99 $1.43 99 $1.03 04

24/CS

$2.75 99 $1.90 99 $1.60 05

12/CS

$2.03 99 $2.38 10 $2.61 08

12/CS

2801400

/GBC

7223WE/

QUILL



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID $1.41 02

12/CS

$0.77 01 $0.54 06 $0.67 99

$0.72 99 $0.51 07 $0.39 08

$2.89 01 $0.54 99 $0.67 99

NB51753

2

11172QL

/QUILL

517540/

OXFORD

SCHOOL 

SMART 

088725

APC 

IND35BL

APC 

IND35CN



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$2.89 01 $0.54 99 $0.67 99

$0.77 01 $0.54 99 $0.67 99

$0.44 07 $0.29 12 $0.25 11

517557/

OXFORD

517565/

OXFORD

30Q/OXF

ORD

SCHOOL 

SMART 

088726

SCHOOL 

SMART 

088727

APC 

IND35RD

APC 

IND35GN



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.02 06 $0.55 99 $0.48 07

$0.87 02 $0.55 99 $0.48 07

$1.44 01 $0.84 99 $0.83 99

$0.52 01 $0.31 99 $0.25 09

40QQQ/O

XFORD

41QQ/OX

FORD

50QQ/OX

FORD

SCHOOL 

SMART 

088714

ALT 

BRAND 

NOT 

LISTED



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.30 04 $0.85 99 $0.83 08

NO BID $11.75 03 $0.28 02

$0.17 05 $0.16 03 $0.16 06

51Q/OXF

ORD

720100/

QUILL

31QQ/OX

FORD

SCHOOL 

SMART 

088713

**ELMER

S MIN 

$750   

96/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$0.22 02 $0.17 06 $0.20 07

$0.63 02 $0.36 99 $0.42 05

$3.55 99 $0.87 99 $0.94 06

SCHOOL 

SMART 

032403

$2.97 99 $0.16 99 $0.13 99

720500/

QUILL

720100/ 

ACCO

SCHOOL 

SMART 

032400



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$6.09 99 $0.47 99 $0.39 15

PIKS/QU

ILL

PIJG/QU

ILL

SCHOOL 

SMART 

084472

BSN6563

8



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$5.99 01 $0.75 99 $0.60 10

NO BID NO BID $0.65 02

$2.49 99 $0.84 99 $0.69 09

NO BID $4.05 99 $0.19 06

717646/

QUILL



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$2.17 99 $0.73 11 $0.70 12

$3.06 06 $0.46 99 $0.43 04

$1.75 01 $1.95 $1.26 03

SCHOOL 

SMART 

081887

SCHOOL 

SMART 

009219

EBA05/Q

UARTET

81505/ 

EXPO ** MIN 

CHARLES 

LEONARD 

$500  

12/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$5.02 99 $0.58 99 $0.56 12

$2.07 07 $0.58 12 $0.61 13

SCHOOL 

SMART 

077355

81505/ 

EXPO

70521Q/ 

PAPERMA

TE

** MIN 

CHARLES 

LEONARD 

$500  

12/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$22.99 01 $6.54 99 $4.90 14

$12.93 99 $6.12 99 $5.87 05

$5.02 99 $4.97 99 $4.21 12

** 5/CS

**MIN  

TOPS/ES

SELTE/O

XFORD 

$1000   

5/CS

** MIN 

$1000 

5/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$5.02 99 $4.81 99 $3.72 01

$7.40 99 $6.12 99 $5.87 04

$8.81 99 $6.83 99 $5.90 11

** 

10/CS

** 5/CS

** 5/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID $7.81 99 $7.57 06

** /CS

$18.34 99 NO BID $3.26 07

** 5/CS

$11.16 99 NO BID $4.12 01

51743/O

XFORD

** 5/CS



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

** 5/CS

$6.29 99 NO BID $3.26 07

** 5/CS

$15.41 02 NO BID $3.26 02

** 5/CS

$2.19 01 $0.91 01 $0.72 01

** MIN 

$750  

48/CS

NO BID $14.19 01 $9.75 O1

 **2/CS

E1326NR

SS

905481S

TP/STAP

LES

895245/

OXFORD



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$0.44 02 $0.26 14 $0.30 10

$0.44 02 NO BID $0.31 02

$1.88 01 NO BID $1.18 03

11109Q/

AVERY

111101/

AVERY

68620/ 

TOMBO



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.58 99 $0.92 99

$1.89 01 NO BID $0.92 11

SCHOOL 

SMART 

038162

68620/ 

TOMBO

BIC 

GSF11BK



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID $0.57 11 $0.95 99

$1.19 14 $0.58 99 $0.92 14

NO BID $0.58 08 $7.70 08

36/CS

NO BID NO BID $0.95 09

NO BID $0.58 99 $7.70 08

SCHOOL 

SMART 

038159 36/CS

SCHOOL 

SMART 

038158

SANFORD 

3371131



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID $1.83 14

NO BID NO BID $1.83 10

NO BID NO BID $1.83 10



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID $8.18 99 $5.45 15

12/CS

$6.74 01 $8.18 01 $5.46 01

24/CS

$4.61 99 NO BID $4.34 06



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$4.79 99 NO BID $4.34 06

$1.88 99 $1.66 99 $0.75 10

$4.47 02 $2.77 01 $1.26 03

6/CS

NO BID $2.77 01 $1.46 03



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.06 99 $0.91 09 $0.81 09

NO BID NO BID $0.69 04

12/CS

$33.06 05 $32.66 05 $25.43 05

$3.44 99 NO BID $1.69 08



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID $1.18 10 $0.66 11

NO BID $0.83 99 $0.69 10

CREATIV

ITY 

STREET 

PAC7112-

02



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$14.86 01 $13.29 01 $11.10 01

$10.98 01 $11.09 01 $8.76 01

 

$5.72 01 $4.96 01 $3.91 01

NO BID $23.99 01 $1.58 01

75 Pks of 

12 @

PK OF 

14



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.31 01 NO BID $0.349 01

Withdrew 

-

clerical 

error

$0.94 01 NO BID $0.349 01

Withdrew 

-

clerical 

error

NO BID NO BID $0.349 01

Withdrew 

-

clerical 

error

NO BID NO BID NO BID
DISCONT

INUED

$9.61 01 NO BID $6.76 99/01

507256/

EXPO

SANFORD 

86001



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$7.32 99 $11.22 14 $9.58 09

$1.86 99 $0.61 11 $0.42 07

$2.00 03 NO BID $1.62 03

735707/

QUILL



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$4.55 02 $8.31 99 $3.67 02

NO BID NO BID $0.42 99

NO BID $0.72 02 $0.57 13

ALLIANC

E 

RUBBER 

CO 

06167

** 

TOPS/E/

OX  

25/CS

** 

TOPS/E/

OX  

25/CS

IMPERIA

L 16920



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID $0.72 03 $0.57 14

NO BID NO BID $0.57 16

ALLIANC

E 

RUBBER 

CO 

06187



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.47 99 NO BID $0.23 04

$0.39 99 NO BID $0.13 11

$1.77 99 $0.66 99 $0.24 06

05221/ 

WESCOTT

2772893

/STAPLE

S

14606/ 

WESCOTT

IMPERIA

L 

1783B5



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.88 99 $0.69 99 $0.24 02

$1.37 03 $0.84 99 $0.60 04

$0.90 99 $0.72 99 $0.44 12

$0.44 99 $0.28 99 $0.21 09

14606/ 

WESCOTT

42515/ 

WESCOTT

SCHOOL 

SMART 

086339



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$0.68 01 $0.59 02 $0.40 12

$12.22 06 $6.47 10 $3.35 10

$32.86 01 $37.79 01 $22.82 01

35108Q/

SWINGLI

NE



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$2.15 01 $0.82 01 $0.79 01

$18.78 99 $2.77 03 $1.75 03

$33.28     

45 PKS OF 

12

NO BID $2.70 99 $2.56 07

$4.68 11 NO BID $4.02 12

7320300

QQW/QUI

LL

SCHOOL 

SMART 

085327



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

** 

12/CS

$11.54 09 NO BID $8.81 07

** 6/CS

NO BID $42.64 01 $31.84 01

$2.23 01 $2.17 01 $1.93 01



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$7.49 01 NO BID $3.22 01

$2.74 01 $2.36 01 $1.69 01

$5.74 01 NO BID $3.85 01

48/CS

NO BID $0.84 13 $0.63 13



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$1.34 05 $1.03 10 $0.81 10

$6.99 02 $2.74 02 $2.06 02

2" x 60 

Yds

$4.47 99 $3.28 01 $2.74 01

36/CS

NO BID $6.56 01 $5.65 01



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID $6.15 08

$3.91 99 $1.03 10 $1.36 02

 

$23.30 01 $26.94 01 $22.84 01

5/CS

JV18244

67CLN



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$8.35 01 $8.10 01 $6.86 01

5/CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$3.02 09 NO BID $1.52 09

3/CS

$1.89 07 NO BID $1.52 07

3/CS

NO BID $1.03 01 $0.76 01

$1.19 01 NO BID $4.05 01

AVE0888

8/AVERY



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

NO BID NO BID $2.49 02

6/CS

$1.73 04 NO BID $1.34 09

12/CS

$2.55 04 NO BID $1.34 07

12/CS

AVE0888

8/AVERY



QUILL LLC BRAND
SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
BRAND

SOUTHWEST 

SCHOOL 

SUPPLY

BRAND

$0.95 99 $0.148 10 $0.21 11

735 PKS OF 

12 @ $1.78 

$3.00 99 NO BID $1.40 01

6/CS


