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EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. 2950 

Bid 2950 Utility Cart, Commercial, and Fleet Vehicle Parts & Repairs 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 13, 2023 at 12:00 pm 
Report Generated:  Tuesday, October 24, 2023 

 
RATE FOR LISTED ITEMS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

  A-Z Bus Sales INC Creative Bus Sales, Inc. Golf Car Central Service 

Line 
Item 

Description 
Hourly 
Rate 

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

1 Labor Hourly $ $190.00  $175.00  $140.00  

2 Rate Overtime $ No Bid $175.00  $210.00  

3 
Transportation rates to and from vendor 

and District Transportation yard 
$ $250.00  $100.00  $20.00  

4 Estimated round trip mileage $ $650.00  $550.00  $40.00  

5 Field repairs $ $190.00  $175.00  $140.00  

6 Rates - Field repair and Mileage rates $ No Bid $175.00  $20.00  

7 Estimated Round Trip Mileage - Body $ No Bid $175.00  $40.00  

8 Hourly Rate $ No Bid $175.00  $140.00  

9 Fabrication hourly rate $ No Bid $175.00  $140.00  

10 Paint - hourly Rate $ No Bid $175.00  $140.00  

11 Frame - Hourly Rate $ No Bid $175.00  $140.00  

12 Aluminum Material - Hourly Rate $ No Bid $175.00  $140.00  

13 Repair Parts - Cost +% % $20.00  $25.00  $15.00  

14 Accessory items cost + % % No Bid $25.00  $15.00  

 


