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EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. Bid 2977 

Bid 2977 LED Video Wall System 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: February 13, 2024 at 10:00 am 

 
 
BID 2977 LED VIDEO WALL SYSTEM   
The District currently owns one LED Video Wall System. The District anticipates purchasing an additional four to five (4 to 5) systems containing near 
identical components within the next 90-120 days (Exhibit A).   
 
In addition, the District is considering the use of LED Video Wall Systems to serve in other environments such as gymnasiums, outdoor events, 
conference rooms and the like and seeks one supplier to meet its current and future product needs. With all factors considered such as cases and 
training costs, TechLedWall is the overall lowest supplier. 
 
 
 
EXHIBIT A EXAMPLE PRICING  
Exhibit A Example pricing is based on a fully configured screen size of 19.7’ x 9.84’ comprising of seventy-two 3.9 Pixel Pitch Screens.  
 

  CDH PRODUCTIONS Mega LED Technology 
Pacific West Sound Professional 

Audio & Design, Inc. 
SOLOTECH SALES & 

INTEGRATION USA INC 
TechLedWall 

Line Item Description 
Unit of 

Measure 
Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments 

1 
3.9 Pixel Pitch Screen                      

(Weatherproof) 
72 

$60,840.00  
(72 x $845) 

  
$32,400.00  
(72 x $450)   

$28,955.52  
(72 x $402.16)   

$87,231.00 
(Bid as 

Complete)  
  

$28,800.00  
(72 x $400) 
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  EXHIBIT A 
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BID 2977 LED VIDEO WALL SYSTEM   
Line-Item Tabulation 
 

  CDH PRODUCTIONS Mega LED Technology 
Pacific West Sound 

Professional Audio & Design, 
Inc. 

SOLOTECH SALES & 
INTEGRATION USA INC 

TechLedWall 

Line 
Item 

Description 
Unit of 

Measure 
Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments Unit Cost Comments 

1 
3.9 Pixel Pitch 

Screen 
(Weatherproof) 

ea. $845.00    $450.00    $402.16    $87,231.00    $400.00    

2 
3.9 Pixel Pitch 

Screen (Concave) 
ea. $730.00    $390.00    $433.66    No Bid   $400.00    

3 
3.9 Pixel Pitch 

screen (Indoor) 
ea. $625.00    $390.00    $370.66    $87,231.00    $375.00    

4 
2.8 Pixel Pitch 

Screen 
(Weatherproof) 

ea. $1,100.00    No Bid   $480.90   No Bid   $440.00    

5 
2.8 Pixel Pitch 

Screen (Concave) 
ea. $820.00    $420.00    $512.40   No Bid   $440.00    

6 
2.8 Pixel Pitch 

Screen (Indoor) 
ea. $725.00    $420.00    $435.23   No Bid   $400.00    

7 
2.5 Pixel Pitch 

Screen 
(Weatherproof) 

ea. $1,355.00    No Bid   $654.16    No Bid   $550.00    

8 
2.5 Pixel Pitch 

Screen (Concave) 
ea. $930.00    $480.00    $685.66    No Bid   $550.00    

9 
2.5 Pixel Pitch 

Screen (Indoor) 
ea. $825.00    $480.00    $504.53    No Bid   $500.00    
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  CDH PRODUCTIONS Mega LED Technology 
Pacific West Sound 

Professional Audio & Design, 
Inc. 

SOLOTECH SALES & INTEGRATION 
USA INC 

TechLedWall 

Line 
Item 

Description 
Unit of 

Measure 
Unit 
Cost 

Comments 
Unit 
Cost 

Comments 
Unit 
Cost 

Comments 
Unit 
Cost 

Comments 
Unit 
Cost 

Comments 

10 
Discount 

Percentage 
on Cases 

ea. $325.00  

Road case hold 12 
units, please see 

attached 
documents 

No Bid   $240.00  25% $0.00  

30% discount on MSRP 
for all gear, including 

cases, misc. parts, and 
accessories 

$0.00  All cases are Included 

11 

Discount 
Percentage 

on Misc. 
Parts and 

Accessories 

ea. $675.00  

Maintenance Kit 
includes, 6 

Modules, 1 Power 
Supply, 1 Receiving 
Card, 1 Hub Card, 
Misc Connectors, 

please see attached 
documents 

No Bid   $0.00    $0.00  

30% discount on MSRP 
for all gear, including 

cases, misc. parts, and 
accessories 

$0.00  

Power & Data: - Main Power 
- Power Cabinets - Power 

Cabinets Blue/Blue - Power 
Cabinets Grey/Grey - Data 

Cabinets - Main Data _ 
BASIC Replacement Parts 

Kit: -Modules - Left and right 
-Power Supply -Receiving 

Card -Flex cables - Remove 
Tool 

12 

Estimated 
Delivery Lead 

Times 
(Use 

Comments 
Field) 

ea.   

2-3 weeks for In 
Stock items/ 8-10 

weeks for Made to 
Order, please see 

attached 
documents 

No Bid 16 weeks $0.00  7 Weeks $0.00  
30-120 Days, pending 
the date of contract 

execution 
$0.00  

We have inventory in US 
soil, so delivery from Doral 

Florida could take 20 
business days, plus 10 days 
of preparing the order, for a 

maximum of 30 days. 

13 

Free Onsite 
Training 
Available 

(Use 
Comments 

Field) 

ea.   

Free training with 
Clovis based local 

support, please see 
attached 

documents 

$3,500  

$3500 for onsite. 
Free Lifetime 

Software training 
via 

remote/screenshare 

$0.00  Free Training $0.00  
Training and Instruction 
Materials provided with 

purchase 
$0.00  

We will send one tech 
expert for one (1) business 
day for training purposes. 
Besides that, it is included 
online free support during 

the 2 year warranty. 

14 

Warranty 
Duration        

(Use 
Comments 

Field) 

ea.   

RefreshLED 4 year 
manufacturer's 

warranty/INFiLED 2 
year manufacturer's 

warranty, please 
see attached 
documents 

No Bid 1 Year Parts $0.00  5 Years $0.00  

2 years standard limited 
warranty; extended 

warranty available upon 
request 

$0.00  2 years 

 
 


