

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q	R	S	T	U	V	W	X	Y		
1	CUSO Quote 802 Tally				CPG	PYRAMID		OFFICE DEPOT		QUILL		SPICERS		SOUTHWEST SCHOOL		SCHOO L SPECIA LTY											
2	PRODUCT #	AMOUNT	U/M	Descriptio	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND	Price	VENDOR	BRAND		
5	1540034	50	box	Envel 6x9			No Bid	\$30.350	8	\$58.990	?		\$43.150	10		No Bid	\$29.710	12					25.520		9		
6	1540036	200	box	Envel 10x13			No Bid	\$8.000	6	\$29.990	?		\$14.490	99		No Bid	\$7.920	13					7.890	8 - 20131			
7	1540038	100	box	Envel 12x15			No Bid	\$12.300	6	\$39.990	?		\$32.360	10		No Bid	\$12.160	12					12.100		8		
8	1540074	100	ream	Paper Binder			No Bid	\$2.870	5	\$2.930	?		\$9.120	5		No Bid	\$2.900	10					2.760		8		
9	1540132	500	ream	Bond kj white	\$4.498	Boise X9						No Bid	\$5.500	?		\$6.990	99	\$4.560	500 ream min - Pacsetter 1500815			\$4.600	9		5.100	9	
10	1540135	500	ream	Canary Bond	\$3.975							No Bid	\$5.000	?		\$5.690	99	\$4.090	9			\$3.890	9		5.000	9	
11	1540136	200	ream	Gldrd Bond	\$3.975							No Bid	\$5.010	?		\$5.690	99	\$4.090	12			\$3.890	12		5.000	12	
12	1540145	300	ream	Green Bond	\$3.975							No Bid	\$5.000	?		\$5.690	99	\$4.090	12			\$3.890	12		5.000	12	
13	1540149	500	ream	Pink Bond	\$3.975							No Bid	\$5.000	?		\$5.690	99	\$4.090	12			\$3.890	12		5.000	12	
14	1540230	100	pkg	Constr/Black			No Bid	\$0.610	3	\$0.850	?		\$2.230	3		No Bid	\$0.609	3					\$0.609	3		0.600	3
15	1540236	50	pkg	Constr/Sky Bl			No Bid	\$0.580	4	\$0.850	?		\$1.190	4		No Bid	\$0.579	4					\$0.579	4		0.580	4
16	1540238	50	pkg	Constr/Brown			No Bid	\$0.610	1	\$0.850	?		\$1.190	99		No Bid	\$0.609	1					\$0.609	1		0.690	1
17	1540240	100	pkg	Constr/dk brown			No Bid	\$0.690	4	\$0.850	?		\$3.480	4		No Bid	\$0.680	4					\$0.680	4		0.690	4
18	1540244	50	pkg	Constr/Em Green			No Bid	\$0.580	4	\$0.850	?		\$1.980	4		No Bid	\$0.579	4					\$0.579	4		0.580	4
19	1540256	50	pkg	Constr/Violet			No Bid	\$0.580	4	\$0.850	?		\$1.980	4		No Bid	\$0.579	4					\$0.579	4		0.580	4
20	1540260	50	pkg	Constr/Yellow			No Bid	\$0.580	4	\$0.850	?		\$2.070	4		No Bid	\$0.579	4					\$0.579	4		0.580	4
21	1540262	50	pkg	Constr/yello-orange			No Bid	\$0.610	3			No Bid				No Bid	\$0.680	3								No Bid	3
22	1540270	200	pkg	Constr/Black			No Bid	\$1.220	3	\$1.630	?		\$5.800	3		No Bid	\$1.209	3					\$1.220	3		1.220	3
23	1540272	200	pkg	Constr/Blue			No Bid	\$1.130	4	\$1.630	?		\$3.810	4		No Bid	\$1.119	4					\$1.119	4		1.130	4
24	1540274	500	pkg	Constr/Sky Bl			No Bid	\$1.130	4	\$1.630	?		\$2.900	4		No Bid	\$1.119	4					\$1.119	4		1.130	4
25	1540276	400	pkg	Constr/Brown			No Bid	\$1.240	4	\$1.630	?		\$2.290	99		No Bid	\$1.220	4					\$1.220	4		1.240	4
26	1540278	200	pkg	Constr/dk brwn			No Bid	\$1.330	4	\$1.700	?		\$4.390	4		No Bid	\$1.310	4					\$1.310	4		1.330	4
27	1540284	50	pkg	Constr/tr Green			No Bid	Discontinued		\$1.590	?		\$4.970	10		No Bid	\$1.220	4					\$1.220	4		No Bid	4
28	1540288	100	pkg	Constr/Mag			No Bid	Discontinued?				No Bid	\$2.150	4		No Bid	\$1.220	4					\$1.220	4		No Bid	4
29	1540290	200	pkg	Constr/Orange			No Bid	\$1.320	4	\$1.630	?		\$4.390	4		No Bid	\$1.230	4					\$1.230	4		1.330	4
30	1540292	200	pkg	Constr/Pink			No Bid	\$1.130	4	\$1.630	?		\$4.390	4		No Bid	\$1.119	4					\$1.119	4		1.130	4
31	1540294	200	pkg	Constr/Red			No Bid	\$1.470	4	\$1.590	?		\$3.560	4		No Bid	\$1.330	4					\$1.330	4		1.400	4
32	1540296	300	pkg	Constr/Hal Red			No Bid	\$1.470	4	\$1.630	?		\$4.390	4		No Bid	\$1.430	4					\$1.430	4		1.530	4
33	1540298	100	pkg	Constr/Scarlet			No Bid	\$1.330	4			No Bid	\$4.560	4		No Bid	\$1.310	4					\$1.310	4		No Bid	4
34	1540302	1,000	pkg	Constr/WWhite			No Bid	\$1.320	4	\$1.600	?		\$4.140	4		No Bid	\$1.309	4					\$1.309	4		1.320	4
35	1540304	200	pkg	Constr/Yellow			No Bid	\$1.130	4	\$1.630	?		\$2.290	4		No Bid	\$1.119	4					\$1.119	4		1.130	4
36	1540350	64	ream	Drawing paper			No Bid	\$5.190	4	\$6.830	?		\$13.770	4		No Bid	\$5.080	8					\$5.080	8		5.010	7
37	1540356	104	ream	Drawing paper			No Bid	\$5.950	4	\$9.150	?		\$24.060	4		No Bid	\$5.830	9					\$5.830	9		5.770	11
38	1540358	100	ream	Drawing paper			No Bid	\$11.770	4	\$13.220	?		\$27.380	4		No Bid	\$11.530	11					\$11.530	11		23.390	4
39	1540447	40	pkg	Finger paint			No Bid	\$2.990	2			No Bid	\$9.950	pacon 73600		No Bid	\$2.870	4					\$2.870	4		2.860	7
40	1540449	100	ream	Astro/Teal	\$6.435		3					No Bid	\$15.990	?		\$19.080	3	\$6.930	3			\$6.430	3		13.840	3	
41	1540450	16	case	Index/Blue	\$51.680		4					No Bid	\$55.920	?		\$116.190	4	\$52.080	2			\$44.800	8		77.840	9	
42	1540451	100	ream	Astro/Gam Gr	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		\$8.390	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1 - 21548	
43	1540452	8	case	Index/Buf	\$51.680		4					No Bid	\$5.92/case	?		No Bid	\$2.05/case	6	\$4.800	6			\$4.800	6		No Bid	6
44	1540454	8	case	Index/Cherry	\$51.680		4					No Bid	\$5.92/case	?		No Bid	\$2.05/case	2	\$4.800	7			\$4.800	7		No Bid	7
45	1540457	100	ream	Astro/Puls Pink	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		\$19.080	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21038	
46	1540458	8	case	Index/Salmon	\$51.680		4					No Bid				No Bid	\$2.05/case	3	\$4.800	7			\$4.800	7		no bid	7
47	1540459	100	ream	Astro/Cos Or	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		\$19.080	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21658	
48	1540460	96	case	Index/White	\$46.000		4					No Bid	\$8.56/case	?		\$7.19/case	4	\$4.92/case	7			\$4.420	9		109.120	4-40508	
49	1540461	100	ream	Astro/Rentry R	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$7.280	?		\$19.080	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21558	
50	1540462	8	case	Index/Yellow	\$51.680		4					No Bid	\$5.92/case	?		\$136.08/cas	10	\$2.05/case	2			\$4.800	10		77.840	1-48548	
51	1540463	150	ream	Astro/ Pin Purp	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		\$19.080	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21678	
52	1540464	100	ream	Astro/Lun Blue	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		\$19.080	1	\$6.930	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21528	
53	1540465	60	ream	Astro/Fuschia	\$6.435		1					No Bid				No Bid	\$6.930	Astro 21849	\$6.430	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21688
54	1540466	100	ream	Astro/Rocket Red	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$7.120	?		No Bid	\$6.930	1	\$6.430	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1
55	1540467	50	ream	Astro Terra Green	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$7.230	?		No Bid	\$6.930	1	\$6.430	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21588
56	1540468	100	ream	Astro/Sol Vel	\$6.435		1					No Bid	\$6.990	?		No Bid	\$6.930	1	\$6.430	1			\$6.430	1		13.380	1-21538
57	1540469	96	ream	Lunar Blue newsruled	\$6.400		1					No Bid	\$7.790	?		No Bid	\$6.860	1	\$6.380	1			\$6.380	1		14.100	1
58	1540576	40	ream	12x9			No Bid					No Bid				No Bid							\$5.460	8		No Bid	8
59	1540631	20	roll	Proj/Black			No Bid	\$8																			