
809 Arts and Crafts Recap

Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand Unit Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes

195.00$           

Cascade 
School 
Supplies NO BID Quill

91.80$             

Cascade 
School 
Supplies NO BID Quill

154.00$           

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 09 0.24$         84.58$            Quill

SOLD 
IN 12 
PACK

97.92$             

Cascade 
School 
Supplies NO BID Quill

58.32$             

Cascade 
School 
Supplies NO BID Quill
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809 Arts and Crafts Recap

Quote 809 Arts and Crafts for Warehouse Stock - March 21, 2022
Recap from Bid responses

Line Prod # Quantity UOM Description Brand Unit Price Vendor Notes Brand  Unit Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand
 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price 

7 1060180 504 BOX

CHALK,ART,12 
COLORS PER 
BOX,1 STICK 
EACH COLOR, 
2 3/4 X 7/16" 
ROUND No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials 01 1.58$        796.32$          

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies 01 1.44$      725.76$             Pyramid 01 1.67$     841.68$             

School 
Specialty

Crayola 51-
0403 
SS#007632 01 1.43$     720.72$           Southwest

Crayola $750 
min combined 
72/CS (QTY 
Adjusted due 
to vendor 
requirement of 
ordering in 
cases of 12 pk 
boxes-9 CS 
needed) 01 2.34$      

8 1060225 108 PKG

CLAY, 
MODELING,PL
ASTIC, 4 
ASSORTED 
COLORS PER 
PKG. 1 LB PKG No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials No Bid

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies 05 1.32$      142.56$             Pyramid

12/CS 
CRAYOLA 
MIN IS $850 
IN FULL 
CASES 05 1.54$     166.32$             

School 
Specialty

Crayola 57-
0300 
SS#007620 05 1.32$     142.56$           Southwest

Crayola $750 
min combined 
12/CS(QTY 
Adjusted due 
to vendor 
requirement of 
ordering in 
cases of 12 pk 
boxes-7 CS 
needed) 03 2.18$      

9 1060290 2016 BOX

CRAYON, REG 
SIZE, 8 COLOR 
BOX, 3 5/8" X 
5/16" TUCK 
BOX, WAX 
CRAYON NON 
TOXIC No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials No Bid

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies 01 0.26$      524.16$             Pyramid

288 
BXS/CASE, 
$850 
CRAYOLA 
MIN ORDER 
IN FULL 
CASE 01 0.29$     584.64$             

School 
Specialty

Crayola 52-
0008 
SS#007503 01 0.26$     524.16$           Southwest

Crayola $750 
min combined 
48/CS (QTY 
Adjusted due 
to vendor 
requirement of 
ordering 
48/CS. 42 CS 
needed) 04 0.78$      

10 1510533 2160 SET

PENCIL, 
COLOR 12 
ASSORTED 
PER SET 
MINIMUM 3.3 
MM No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials 09 1.12$        2,419.20$       

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies

Crayola 68-
O12 09 1.07$      2,311.20$          Pyramid

48 SETS/CS, 
$850 
CRAYOLA 
MIN ORDER 
IN FULL 
CASE 09 1.19$     2,570.40$          

School 
Specialty

Crayola 160-
1456 
SS#160-
1456 09 1.02$     2,203.20$        Southwest

Crayola $750 
min combined, 
48/CS (48 CS 
needed) 09 2.15$      

11 1510580 1008 SET

PENCIL SET,12 
COLOR, 3 1/2" 
LENGTH 
*MUST BE 
DELIVERED 
IN FULL 
CASES No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials No Bid

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies 10 0.79$      796.32$             Pyramid

48 SETS/CS, 
$850 
CRAYOLA 
MIN ORDER 
IN FULL 
CASE 10 0.76$     766.08$             

School 
Specialty

Crayola 68-
4112 
SS#008223 10 0.66$     665.28$           Southwest

Crayola $750 
min combined, 
48/CS (QTY 
Adjusted due 
to vendor 
requirement of 
ordering 
48/CS. 21 CS 
needed) No Bid
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809 Arts and Crafts Recap

Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand Unit Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes

1,179.36$        

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 1 4.14$         2,086.56$       Quill

235.44$           

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 5 2.10$         226.80$          Quill

1,572.48$        

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 1 0.53$         1,068.48$       Quill

-$                

4,644.00$        

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 9 3.03$         6,544.80$       Quill

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 10 2.81$         2,832.48$       Quill
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809 Arts and Crafts Recap

Quote 809 Arts and Crafts for Warehouse Stock - March 21, 2022
Recap from Bid responses

Line Prod # Quantity UOM Description Brand Unit Price Vendor Notes Brand  Unit Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand
 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand

 Unit 
Price 

12 1510550 7416 BOX

MARKERS, 
WATERCOLOR
, WASHABLE, 
BOX OF 8 
BULLET TIP, 
LG. BULLET 
TIP. NON 
TOXIC. (24 
PER CASE) No Bid

Blick Art 
Materials 01 1.80$        13,348.80$     

National 
Art & 
School 
Supplies 03 1.36$      10,085.76$        Pyramid

24 
BXS/CASE, 
$600 
CRAYOLA 
MIN ORDER 
IN FULL 
CASE (QTY 
Adjusted due 
to vendor 
requirement of 
ordering in 
cases 24/CS. 
309 CS 
needed ) 01 1.77$     13,126.32$        

School 
Specialty

Crayola 58-
7808 
SS#008196 03 2.13$     15,796.08$      Southwest

Dixon $550 
Min, 24/CS 03 1.99$      

No Bid Total Bid 16,564.32$     14,994.98$        18,246.22$        20,323.98$      

10,085.76$        

$600 CRAYOLA 
MIN ORDER IN 
FULL CASE 99.96$              

No 
minimum 
required 
for 
awarded 
items 4,330.38$        

Crayola $750 
minimum order 
combined

Item 1060290 award determined by coin toss of 2 lowest bidder price per unit
14,516.10$        

Total Bid Total Bid Total Bid

Item 1060225 award determined by coin toss of 2 lowest bidder price per unit

Total Bid

Pyramid Award
School Specialty 

Award Southwest Award
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809 Arts and Crafts Recap

Ext Price Vendor Notes Brand Unit Price  Ext Price Vendor Notes

14,757.84$      

Cascade 
School 
Supplies 1 4.15$         30,776.40$     Quill

22,986.16$      43,620.10$     Total Bid
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